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Abstract : This study reveals the extension and continuity between the classical Arabic poetry and modern Arabic poetry
through investigation of its ambiguity, symbolism, and antithetical relationships. The significance of this study lies in its
exploration and discovering of a new method of reading classical and modern Arabic poetry. The study deals with the Fatimid
poetry and discovers a new method to read it. It also deals with the relationship between the apparent and the hidden
meanings of words through focusing on how the paradoxical antithetical relationships change the meaning of the whole poem
and give it a different dimension through the use of Oxymorons. In our unprecedented research on Oxymoron, we found out
that the words in modern Arabic poetry are used in unusual combinations that convey apparent and hidden meanings. In some
cases, the poet introduces an image with a symbol of a certain thing, but the reader soon discovers that the symbol includes its
opposite, too. The question is: How does the reader find that hidden harmony in that apparent disharmony? The first and most
important conclusion of this study is that the Fatimid poetry was written for two types of readers: religious readers who know
the religious symbols and the hidden secret meanings behind the words, and ordinary readers who understand the apparent
literal meaning of the words. Consequently, the interpretation of the poem is subject to the type of reading. In Fatimid poetry
we found out that the hunting-journey is a journey of hidden esoteric knowledge; the Horse is al-Naqib, a religious rank of the
investigator and missionary; the Lion is Ali Ibn Abi Talib. The words black and white, day and night, bird, death and murder
have different meanings and indications. Our study points out the importance of reading certain poems in certain periods in
two different ways: the first depends on a doctrinal interpretation that transforms the external apparent (ẓāher) meanings into
internal inner hidden esoteric (bāṭen) ones; the second depends on the interpretation of antithetical relationships between the
words in order to reveal meanings that the poet hid for a reader who participates in the processes of creativity. The second
conclusion is that the classical poem employed symbols, oxymora and antonymous and antithetical forms to create two poetic
texts in one mold and form. We can conclude that this study is pioneering in showing the constant paradoxical relationship
between the apparent and the hidden meanings in classical and modern Arabic poetry.
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