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Abstract : Introduction: The objectives of the study are to assess different aspects of the tourism and hospitality industry,
analyze its contributions to the Gross Domestic Product of Bangladesh, identify the importance of the tourism and hospitality
industry, explore future prospects in the sectors, identify challenges and provide recommendations for the development of
these industries. The study explores the significance of the tourism and hospitality industry in economic growth and defines its
role. Tourism is one of the fastest-growing industries in the world today. Methodology: The study adopts statistical methods
and utilizes both quantitative and qualitative research techniques.  Data is  collected through surveys,  interviews,  visitor
registration, online platforms and analysis of various tourism-related records. The study focuses on marketing, management,
attractions and services in the tourism and hospitality sectors.  Result:  The tourism and hospitality industry offers great
opportunities  for  emerging  economies  and  developing  countries.  The  industry  provides  job  creation,  infrastructure
development,  cultural  assets  and  environmental  conservation,  essential  skills  development,  revenue  generated,  foreign
exchange  earned,  economic  growth  and  reduced  poverty  and  inequality.  Discussion:  The  study  focuses  on  improving
infrastructure  and  service  quality  in  the  tourism and  hospitality  industry  to  attract  tourists.  The  industry  significantly
contributes to the Gross Domestic Product of Bangladesh. It highlights how the tourism and hospitality sectors can drive
economic development, reduce poverty and promote cultural and environmental conservation. It also explores the challenges
and future prospects in the tourism and hospitality sectors. Conclusion and Future Scope: The opportunities for tourism of
Bangladesh are agricultural tourism, religious tourism, sports tourism, eco-tourism, educational tourism, rural tourism and
cultural tourism. However, there is a lack of research and plans to explore the development of the industry. The tourism and
hospitality  industry  offers  numerous  opportunities  for  growth  and  development.  There  are  job  opportunities  for  travel
consultants, tour operators, event planners, hotel managers, travel writers, tourism development officers and airline executives
in the future. The study recommends to development of tourism infrastructure, maintaining tourist destinations,  railway
stations, airports, rest houses, hotels and improving the quality of services.
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