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Abstract : The purpose of this study was to investigate German tourists' demand for Ethiopian tourism destinations. The
author has made every effort to identify the differences in the preferences of German visitors’ demand in Ethiopia comparing
with Egypt, Kenya, Tanzania, and South African tourism sectors if they are invited to visit at the same time. However, the
demand of international tourism for Ethiopia currently lags behind these African countries. Therefore, to offer demand-driven
tourism products, the Ethiopian government, Tour & Travel operators need to understand the important factors that affect
international tourists’ decision to visit Ethiopian tourist destinations. The aim of this study was intended to analyze German
Tourists’ Demand towards Ethiopian destination. The researcher aimed to identify the demand for German tourists’ preference
to Ethiopian tourist destinations comparing to the above-mentioned African countries. For collecting and analysing data for this
study, both quantitative and qualitative methods of research are being used in this study. The most significant data are
collected by using the primary data collection method i.e. survey and interviews which are the most and large number of
potential responses and feedback from nine German active tourists,12 Ethiopian tourism officials, four African embassies, and
four well  functioning private tour companies and secondary data collected from books,  journals,  previous research and
electronic websites. based on the data analysis of the information gathered from interviews and questionnaires, the study
disclosed that majority of German tourists have not that much high demand on Ethiopian Tourist destinations due to the
following reasons; Many Germans are fascinated by adventures, safari and simply want to lie on the beach and relax. These
interests have leaded them to look for other African countries which have these accesses. Uncomfortable infrastructure and
transport  problems attributed for  the decreasing the number of  German tourists  in  the country.  Inadequate marketing
operation of Ethiopian Tourism Authority and its delegates in advertising and clarifying the above irregularities which are
raised by the tourists.
Keywords : environmental benefits of tourism, social benefits of tourism, economical benefits of tourism, political factors in
tourism
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