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Abstract : Background: Validation of communication activities of daily living-second edition (CADL-2) and assessment of
language-related  functional  activities  (ALFA)  tests  is  a  critical  investment  decision,  and  activities  related  to  language
impairments  often  are  underestimated.  Literature  indicates  that  age  factors,  and  gender  differences  may  affect  the
performance of the aphasics. Thus, understanding these influential factors is highly important to neuropsycholinguists and
speech language pathologists (SLPs). Purpose: The goal of this study is twofold: (1) to in/validate CADL-2 and ALFA tests, and
(2) to investigate whether or not the two assessment tests are reliable. Design: A comparative study is made between the
results obtained from the analyses of the Arabic versions of CADL-2 and ALFA tests. Participants: The communication activities
of daily-living and language-related functional activities were assessed from the obtained results of 100 adult aphasics (50
males, 50 females; ages 16 to 65). Procedures: Firstly, the two translated and standardized Arabic versions of CADL-2 and
ALFA tests were introduced to the Arab aphasics under investigation. Armed with the new two versions of the tests, one of the
researchers  assessed the  language-related  functional  communication  and activities.  Outcomes drawn from the  obtained
analysis of the comparative studies were then qualitatively and statistically analyzed. Main outcomes and Results: Regarding
the validity of CADL-2 and ALFA, it is found that …. Is more valid in both pre-and posttests. Concerning the reliability of the
two tests, it is found that ….is more reliable in both pre-and-posttests which undoubtedly means that …..is more trustable. Nor
must we forget to indicate here that the relationship between age and gender was very weak due to that no remarkable gender
differences between the two in both CADL-2 and ALFA pre-and-posttests. Conclusions & Implications: CADL-2 and ALFA tests
were found to be valid and reliable tests. In contrast to previous studies, age and gender were not significantly associated with
the results of validity and reliability of the two assessment tests. In clearer terms, age and gender patterns do not affect the
validation of  these two tests.  Future studies might focus on complex questions including the use of  CADL-2 and ALFA
functionally; how gender and puberty influence the results in case the sample is large; the effects of each type of aphasia on
the final outcomes, and measurements’ results of imaging techniques.
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