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Abstract : The Government of Jordan recognizes that maternal mortality constitutes a grave public health problem. Over the
past two decades, there has been significant progress in improving the quality of maternal health services, resulting in
improved maternal and child health outcomes. Despite these efforts, measurement and analysis of maternal mortality remained
a challenge, with significant discrepancies from previous national surveys that inhibited accuracy. In response with support
from USAID, the Jordan Maternal Mortality Surveillance Response (JMMSR) System was established to collect, analyze, and
equip  policymakers  with  data  for  decision-making  guided  by  interdisciplinary  multi-levelled  advisory  groups  aiming  to
eliminate preventable maternal deaths, A 2016 Public Health Bylaw required the notification of deaths among women of
reproductive age. The JMMSR system was launched in 2018 and continues annually, analyzing data received from health
facilities, to guide policy to prevent avoidable deaths. To date, there have been four annual national maternal mortality reports
(2018-2021). Data is collected, reviewed by advisory groups, and then consolidated in an annual report to inform and guide the
Ministry of Health (MOH); JMMSR collects the necessary information to calculate an accurate maternal mortality ratio and
assists in identifying leading causes and contributing factors for each maternal death. Based on this data, national response
plans are created. A monitoring and evaluation plan was designed to define, track, and improve implementation through
indicators. Over the past four years, one of these indicators, ‘percent of facilities notifying respective health directorates of all
deaths of women of reproductive age,’ increased annually from 82.16%, 92.95%, and 92.50% to 97.02%, respectively. The
Government of Jordan demonstrated commitment to the JMMSR system by designating the MOH to primarily host the system
and  lead  the  development  and  dissemination  of  policies  and  procedures  to  standardize  implementation.  The  data  was
translated into practical and evidence-based recommendations. The successful impact of results deepened the understanding of
maternal mortality in Jordan, which convinced the MOH to amend the Bylaw now mandating electronic reporting of all births
and neonatal deaths from health facilities to empower the JMMSR system, by developing a stillbirths and neonatal mortality
surveillance and response system.
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