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Abstract : Arunachal Pradesh, located in the easternmost part of India, is known for its natural beauty and diverse tribal
lifestyles. The state has the highest species richness and biological diversity among Northeast states in terms of flora, fauna,
and tribal traditions and culture. The protection of nature and culture is a practice that is widely used by governments or
nongovernmental organizations seeking to preserve the scenic beauty of landscapes and their natural resources in spaces that
stand out for their natural and cultural value and have not been heavily impacted by human activity. The whole of Arunachal
Pradesh comes under the purview of special permits such as the Inner Line Permit (ILP) and Protected Area Permit (PAP) for
domestic and foreign travellers, respectively. Due to politically vibrant areas and naturally fragile in nature, the state needs to
be protected, but at the same time, the demand for tourism activities is increasing gradually due to its unique blend of nature
and socio-cultural richness. There are 13 protected areas in the state which is unexplored, and there are no tourism activities
in these protected areas except for Namdapha National Park. Out of 13 protected areas, the Pakke Wildlife Sanctuary is one of
the well-managed protected areas located near the Assam-Arunachal border, approximately 40km away from Tezpur town,
Assam. The state has great potential for wildlife and nature-based tourism development, which can also indirectly support
wildlife and nature-based livelihood options for the local inhabitants living in the peripheral of the sanctuary area due to its
high richness in terms of flora and fauna. To promote the richness of the state, boost tourism, and the economic, social and
environmental development of the area and local communities, a proper tourism management practice and framework are very
much required. The research paper has made an attempt to study the role of stakeholders in preserving and promoting the
Protected Areas for tourism development in a sustainable way. This is both a primary and secondary study conducted with field
visits, interaction, questionnaire and observation with the various stakeholders and also conducted with the Government
reports, magazines and other published sources available. Furthermore, this study will be relevant to all stakeholders for
having knowledge and processes for promoting tourism in Protected Areas in a sustainable way. The results will provide
relevant information and process for the management and promotion of the protected Areas and to strengthen the sustainable
tourism activities in these areas.
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