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Abstract :  Context:  The research explores the impact of  ideology on the aesthetic reading of  literary texts.  It  aims to
investigate how ideology affects the way in which readers interpret and appreciate literature. The study focuses on a selection
of Arabic novels that have been subject to significant controversy among critics, with some praising their aesthetic value and
others denouncing it. By analyzing this controversy, the research seeks to demonstrate the extent to which ideology influences
aesthetic judgments in literary readings. Research Aim: The aim of this study is to examine the influence of ideology on the
aesthetic reading of literary texts. It seeks to understand how the ideological perspective of readers shapes their interpretation
and evaluation of  literature.  Methodology:  The research adopts  an aesthetic  approach as  the  primary  methodology for
investigating the relationship between literary reading and ideological reception. By employing this approach, the study aims
to uncover the intricate connections between aesthetics and ideology in the process of interpreting and appreciating literature.
Findings: The research reveals that ideology cannot be separated from the aesthetic experience of reading literary texts. It
argues that the ideological perspective of the reader significantly impacts their aesthetic judgments and interpretations. The
differing viewpoints among critics regarding the aesthetic value of the selected Arabic novels highlight the influence of
ideology on readers' assessments of artistic merit. Theoretical Importance: The study contributes to the understanding of the
complex interplay between aesthetics and ideology in the realm of literary interpretation. It reinforces the notion that aesthetic
judgments are not solely based on the intrinsic qualities of the text but are also shaped by the ideological framework of the
reader. Data Collection: The research collects data by examining critical responses to a number of Arabic novels that have
generated controversy. These responses include both positive and negative evaluations of the novels' aesthetic value. The
research also considers the ideological positions and perspectives of the critics. Analysis Procedures: The collected data is
analyzed using an aesthetic lens, taking into account the ideological viewpoints expressed in the critical responses. The
analysis  explores  how these  ideological  perspectives  influence  the  aesthetic  judgments  made  by  the  critics.  Questions
Addressed: The research addresses the question of how ideology impacts the aesthetic reading of literary texts. It investigates
the  extent  to  which  ideology  shapes  readers'  interpretations  and  evaluations  of  literature,  particularly  in  the  case  of
controversial novels. Conclusion: The study concludes that ideology plays a significant role in the aesthetic reading of literary
texts. It demonstrates that readers' ideological perspectives influence their interpretation and evaluation of a text's aesthetic
value.  The  research  highlights  the  interconnectedness  of  aesthetics  and  ideology  in  the  process  of  literary  reception,
emphasizing the importance of considering the ideological framework of readers when analyzing the aesthetic qualities of
literature.
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