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Abstract : Context: Families living in poverty often struggle with poor financial management and accumulating debts. Social
workers play a crucial role in assisting these families, but they typically receive no formal training in financial management.
Research Aim: The aim of this study was to assess the impact of a voluntary organization called Paamonim on social work
students' attitudes toward providing material support and assistance in financial management to families living in poverty.
Additionally, the study aimed to evaluate the students' perception of the workshop's contribution and their actual use of the
tools acquired during the training. Methodology: The study involved 134 social work students, with 55 in a regular program
and 79 in a retraining program. The first stage of the study involved the students receiving an explanation of the research,
ensuring confidentiality, and signing informed consent. The students completed two questionnaires: The Student Attitudes
Questionnaire and a sociodemographic questionnaire. In the second stage, three months after the workshop, the students
completed the questionnaires again, along with a feedback questionnaire. Findings: The study found that there were no
significant differences in the students'  attitudes toward providing material  support and proper financial  management to
families living in poverty before and after the workshop. However, their attitudes remained positive, at a medium level or
higher. The students reported that the workshop provided them with tools to assist families in poverty, and they used these
tools to some extent in their practical training. They found the workshop interesting and acknowledged its importance in
raising  awareness  about  budget  management  and  enriching  their  knowledge  of  money  management.  The  students
acknowledged the workshop's effectiveness but mentioned that it was too short. Theoretical Importance: This study highlights
the importance of developing programs to help families living in poverty manage their household finances. The workshop
enriched the students' knowledge and skills, which are vital for their role as social workers working with families in poverty to
rehabilitate  their  financial  situations.  Data  Collection  and  Analysis  Procedures:  The  students  completed  self-report
questionnaires before and after the workshop, providing insights into their attitudes and perception about the role of social
workers in providing material  support for families living in poverty and helping them manage their household finances.
Statistical analysis was conducted to compare the students' attitudes pre and post-workshop, and a feedback questionnaire
assessed the students' perception of the contribution of the workshop. Question Addressed: This study addressed the question
of whether a workshop on financial management can positively impact social work students' attitudes and skills in assisting
families living in poverty with their household finances. Conclusion: Despite being short and consisting of only one session, the
workshop proved to be valuable in enriching the students' knowledge and providing them with important tools for their role as
social workers. The students reported positive attitudes toward providing material support and financial assistance to families
in need. The practical recommendation is to continue offering such workshops as part of the social work curriculum to further
enhance students' abilities to help families manage their finances effectively.
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