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Abstract : Asthma is a pulmonary disease in which blockade of the airway takes place due to inflammation as a response to
certain allergens. Breathing troubles, cough, and dyspnea are one of the few symptoms. Several studies have indicated a
significant effect on asthma due to changes in dietary routines. Certain food items, such as oily foods and other materials, are
known to cause an increase in the symptoms of asthma. Low dietary intake of fruits and vegetables may be important in
relation to asthma prevalence. The objective of this study is to assess and compare the nutritional status of asthmatic and non-
asthmatic patients. The significance of this study lies in the factor that it will help nutritionists to arrange a feasible dietary
routine for asthmatic patients. This research was conducted at the Pulmonology Department of the Pakistan Institute of
Medical Science Islamabad. About thirty hundred thirty-four million people are affected by asthma worldwide. Pakistan is on
the verge of being an uplifted urban population and asthma cases are increasingly high these days. Several studies suggest an
increase in the Asthmatic patient population due to improper diet. This is a cross-sectional study aimed at assessing the
nutritious standing of Asthmatic and non-asthmatic patients. This research took place at the Pakistan Institute of Medical
Sciences (PIMS), Islamabad, Pakistan. The research included asthmatic and non-asthmatic patients coming to the pulmonology
department clinic at the Pakistan Institute of Medical Sciences (PIMS). These patients were aged between 20-60 years. A
questionnaire was developed for these patients to estimate their dietary plans in these patients. The methodology included four
sections. The first section was the Socio-Demographic profile, which included age, gender, monthly income and occupation.
The next section was anthropometric measurements which included the weight, height and body mass index (BMI) of an
individual. The next section, section three, was about the biochemical attributes, such as for biochemical profiling, pulmonary
function testing (PFT) was performed. In the next section, Dietary habits were assessed by a food frequency questionnaire
(FFQ) through food habits and consumption pattern was assessed. The next section life style data, in which the person's level of
physical activity, sleep and smoking habits were assessed. The next section was statistical analysis. All the data obtained from
the study were statistically analyzed and assessed. Most of the asthma Patients were females, with weight more than normal or
even obese. Body Mass Index (BMI) was higher in asthma Patients than those in non-Asthmatic ones. When the nutritional
Values were assessed, we came to know that these patients were low on certain nutrients and their diet included more junk
and oily food than healthy vegetables and fruits. Beverages intake was also included in the same assessment. It is evident from
this study that nutritional status has a contributory effect on asthma. So, patients on the verge of developing asthma or those
who have developed asthma should focus on their diet, maintain good eating habits and take healthy diets, including fruits and
vegetables rather than oily foods. Proper sleep may also contribute to the control of asthma.
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