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Abstract : By the term “limbic resonance,” we usually refer to a state of deep connection, both emotional and physiological,
between people who, when in resonance, find their limbic systems in tune with one another. Limbic resonance is not only about
sharing emotions but also physiological states. In fact, people in such resonance can influence each other’s heart rate, blood
pressure, and breathing. Limbic resonance is fundamental for human beings to connect and create deep bonds among a certain
group. It is fundamental for our social skills. A relationship between gifted and resonant subjects is perceived as feeling safe,
living the relation like an isle of serenity where it is possible to recharge, to communicate without words, to understand each
others without giving explanations, to strengthen the balance of each member of the group. Within the circle, self-esteem is
consolidated and makes it stronger to face what is outside, others, and reality. The idea that gifted people who are together
may be unfit for the world does not correspond to the truth. The circle made up of people with high cognitive potential
characterized by a limbic resonance is, in general, experienced as a solid platform from which you can safely move away and
where you can return to recover strength. We studied 8 adults (between 21 and 47 years old). All of them with IQ higher than
130. We monitored their brain waves frequency (alpha, beta, theta, gamma, delta) by means of biosensing tracker along with
their physiological states (heart beat frequency, blood pressure, breathing frequency, pO2, pCO2) and some blood works only
(5-HT, dopamine, catecholamines, cortisol). The subjects of the study were asked to adhere to a protocol involving bonding
activities (such as team building activities), role plays, meditation sessions, and group therapy. All these activities were carried
out together. We observed that after about 4 months of activities, their brain waves frequencies tended to tune quicker and
quicker. After 9 months, the bond among them was so important that they could “sense” each other inner states and sometimes
also guess each others’ thoughts. According to our findings, it may be hypothesized that large synchronized outbursts of cortex
neurons produces not only brain waves but also electromagnetic fields that may be able to influence the cortical neurons’
activity of other people’s brain by inducing action potentials in large groups of neurons and this is reasonably conceivable to be
able to transmit information such as different emotions and cognition cues to the other’s brain. We also believe that upcoming
research should focus on clarifying the role of brain magnetic particles in brain-to-brain communication. We also believe that
further investigations should be carried out on the presence and role of cryptochromes to evaluate their potential roles in
direct brain-to-brain communication.
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