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Abstract : Effects of organized crime permeate all facets of life, including public health, socio-economic endeavors, and human
security. If any element of this is affected, it impacts large-scale national and global interest. Seeking to address terrorist
networks through technical thinking is like trying to kill a weed by just cutting off its branches. It will re-develop and expand in
proportions beyond one’s imagination, even in horrific ways that threaten human security. The continent of Africa has been
bedeviled by this menace, with little or no solution to the problem. Nigeria is dealing with a protracted insurgency that is
perpetrated by a sect  against  any form of  westernization.  Reimagining approaches to dealing with pressing issues like
terrorism may require engaging the right set of people in the conversation for any sustainable change. These are people who
have lived through the daily effects of the violence that ensues from the activities of terrorist activities. Effective leadership is
required for an inclusive process, where spaces are created for diverse voices to be heard, and multiple perspectives are
listened to, and not just heard, that supports a determination of the realistic outcome. Addressing insurgency in Nigeria has
experienced a lot of disinformation and uncertainty. This may be in part due to poor leadership or an iteration of technical
solutions  to  adaptive  challenge  peacemaking  efforts  in  Nigeria  has  focused  on  behaviors,  attitudes  and  practices  that
contribute to violence. However, it is important to consider the underlying issues that build-up, ignite and fan the flames of
violence—looking at conflict as a complex system, issues like climate change, low employment rates, corruption and the
impunity of discrimination due to ethnicity and religion. This article will be looking at an option of the more relational way of
addressing insurgency through adaptive approaches that embody engagement and solutions with the people rather than for the
people. The construction of a local turn in peacebuilding is informed by the need to create a locally driven and sustained peace
process that embodies the culture and practices of the people in enacting an everyday peace beyond just a perennial and
universalist outlook. A critical analysis that explores the socially identified individuals and situations will be made, considering
the more adaptive approach to a complex existential challenge rather than a universalist frame. Case Study and Ethnographic
research approach to understand what other scholars have documented on the matter and also a first-hand understanding of
the experiences and viewpoints of the participants.
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