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Abstract : The interest of scholars towards corporate sustainability has strengthened in recent years in parallel with the
growing need to undertake paths of cultural and organizational change, as a way for greater competitiveness and stakeholders’
satisfaction. In fact, studies on the business sustainability, while on the one hand have integrated the three dimensions of
sustainability that existed for some time in the economic approaches (economic, environmental and social dimensions), on the
other hand did not give rise to an organic construct that puts together the aspects of strategic management with corporate
social responsibility and even less with the organizational issues. Therefore some important questions remain open: Which
organizational structure and which operational mechanisms are coherent or propitious to a sustainability strategy? Existing
studies appear to be fragmented, although some aspects have shared importance: knowledge management, human resource,
management,  leadership,  innovation,  etc.  The  construction  of  a  model  of  sustainable  organization  that  supports  the
sustainability strategy no longer seems to be postponed, as is its connection with the main practices of measuring corporate
social responsibility performance. The paper aims to identify the organizational characteristics of a sustainable corporate. To
this end, from a theoretical point of view the work examines the main existing literary contributions and, from a practical point
of view, it presents a business case referring to a service organization that for years has undertaken the sustainability strategy.
This paper is divided into two parts: the first part concerns a review of the main articles on the strategic management topic and
the main organizational issues raised by the literature, such as knowledge management, leadership, innovation, etc.; later, a
modeling of the main variables examined by scholars and an integration of these with the international measurement standards
of CSR is proposed. In the second part, using the methodology of the case study company, the hypotheses and the structure of
the  proposed  model  that  aims  to  integrate  the  strategic  issues  with  the  organizational  aspects  and  measurement  of
sustainability  performance,  are  applied  to  an  Italian  company,  which  has  some  organizational  and  human  resource
management interventions are in place to align strategic decisions with the structure and operating mechanisms of the
structure. The case presented supports the hypotheses of the model.
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