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Abstract : This study interrogates and analyses the intricate kin- and- kith network patterns of corruption and mismanagement
of  resources  prevalent  in  public  sector  supply  chains  bedeviling  the  developing economies  of  Sub-Saharan Africa  with
particular reference to Zimbabwe. This is forcing governments to resort to harsh fiscal policies that see their citizens paying
high taxes against a backdrop of incomes below the poverty datum line, and this negatively affects their quality of life. The
corporate world is also affected by the various tax-regime instituted. Mismanagement of resources and corrupt practices are
rampant in state-owned enterprises to the extent that institutional policies, procedures, and practices are often flouted for the
benefit of a clique of individuals. This interwoven in kith and kin blood human relations in organizations where appointments to
critical positions are based on ascribed status. People no longer place value in their systems to make them work thereby
violating corporate governance principles. Greediness and ‘unholy friendship connections’ are instrumental in fueling the
employment of people who know each other from their discrete backgrounds. Such employments or socio-metric unions are
meant to protect those at the top by giving them intelligent information through spying on what other subordinates are doing
inside and outside the organization. This practice has led to the underperforming of organizations as those employees with
connections and their upper echelons favorites connive to abuse resources for their own benefit. Even if culprits are known, no
draconian measures are employed as a deterrence measure. Public value along public sector supply chains is lost. The study
used a descriptive case study research design on fifty  organizations in Zimbabwe mainly state-owned enterprises.  Both
qualitative and quantitative instrumentations were used. Both Snowball and random sampling techniques were used. The study
found out that in all the fifty SOEs, there were employees in key positions related to top management, with tentacles feeding
into the law enforcement agents, judiciary, security systems, and the executive. Such employees in public seem not to know
each other with but would be involved in dirty scams and then share the proceeds with top people behind the scenes. The study
also established that the same employees do not have the necessary competencies, qualifications, abilities, and capabilities to
be in those positions. This culture is now strong that it is difficult to bust. The study recommends recruitment of all employees
through an independent employment bureau to ensure strategic fit.
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